
Workshop “Shifting Borders of EU Internal Security” 
 18-19 September 2014, Europa-Universität Viadrina 
 
LOCATION:  
Logenstraße 11-12  
Room 101 
15207 Frankfurt Oder 
Germany 
(see map further below) 
 
18th September:  
12:30-13:30 registration and welcome buffet  
 
13:30-15:00  PANEL 1: DEBATING MIGRATION AND INTERNAL SECURITY POLICY 
 

1. Prof. Petra Bendel (Friedrich-Alexander-University of Erlangen-Nuremberg): “How “Smart” are 
Europe’s “Smart Borders”?” 

2. Angela Tacea (Science Po Paris): “Freedom or Security? The role of national parliaments in the Area of 
Freedom, Security and Justice.” 

3. Mathias Bug (DIW Berlin): “Unofficial Grand Coalitions in Internal Security – Looking at the EU with a 
German Lens”  

4. Luana Martin, Mitja Sienknecht, Prof. Jürgen Neyer (Europe University Viadrina) "Contesting migration 
policy: do good arguments matter?"  

 
15:30-17:00  PANEL 2: SHIFTS AND DIFFUSION OF NORMS  

5. Prof. Ariadna Ripoll (Otto-Friedrich-Universität Bamberg): “Protecting or Processing? Recasting EU 
Data Protection Norms.” 

6. Maria O’Neill (University of Dundee): “Police and Judicial Co-operation in Criminal Matters and the 
Brussels Effect.” 

7. Anne Koch (Europe University Viadrina): “The Technocratization and Institutionalization of Migrant 
Return in EU Member States – An Instance of Illiberal Norm Diffusion?” 

 
17:30-19:00  PANEL 3: INTERNAL SECURITY PRACTICES AND DIGITAL TECHNOLOGIES 

8. Helena Carrapico (University of Dundee): “European governance of digital spaces: an exploratory 
analysis of cyber security and cyber crime agencies and their regulatory potential.” 

9. Ben Wagner (European University Viadrina): “Failing a Litmus Test? Developing Cybercrime Policy 
between public pressure and private sector dependency” 

10. Ben Duke (Keele University): “The Role of Education and Cyber-Technology in European Internal 
Security Policy Formulation, There Effect upon European Citizens’ Perception of Borders.” 

 
19:30 CONFERENCE DINNER 
 



19th September 
9.00-10.30 PANEL 3: TECHNOLOGIES AND EU AGENCIES 
 

1. Nicolai von Ondarza, Daniela Kietz (SWP): “The growing network of EU agency in the fields of external 
and internal security – The case of cyber and maritime surveillance”.  

2. Markus Lammert (Europe University Viadrina): “Making the most out of Lisbon. Europol's role in the 
new AFSJ governance environment.” 

3. Paweł Frankowski (Jagiellonian University), Irma Słomczyńska (Maria Curie-Sklodowska University): 
“European Space Policy and European Security”. 
 

10.30-11.00 Coffee 
11.00-12.30 PANEL 3: CHANGING PATTERNS AND OBJECTIVES OF SECURITY GOVERNANCE 

4. Prof. Artur Gruszczak (Jagiellonian University): “Police and Customs Cooperation Centers and their role 
in EU internal security governance.” 

5. Raphael Bossong (Europe University Viadrina): “Political control or renewed professional 
empowerment in EU Internal Security Governance?”  

6. Baran Hanagasi (Bilgi University): “The EU Internal Security Strategy and the Failure to combat 
corruption in Turkey.”  
 

12.30-13.30 Lunch 
 
13.30-15.00 PANEL 4: THE EXTERNAL DIMENSION  

7. Igor Merheim-Eyre (University of Kent): “Protecting citizens, securitising foreigners? Consular Affairs 
and the externalisation of Europe’s borders 

8. Alexandra Schmid, Katsiaryna Yakouchyk (University of Passau) “EU-Belarus Cooperation in Border 
Management: A Liberal Intergouvernmalist Approach“ 

9. Estela Schindler (Konstanz University): “Is the border a line?” Territorial displacements and the 
effacement of agency at the Greek-Turkish border” 
 

15.30-16.00 Closing remarks (publishing plans) and departure 
 
Commentary Prof. Hartmut Aden (HWR Berlin) 
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